
THE MIZORAM SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES OF MINISTER 

 (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2019 

A 

BILL 

further to amend the Mizoram Salaries and Allowances of Minister Act, 1999. 

Be it enacted by the Mizoram Legislative Assembly in the seventieth year of the 

Republic of India as follows: 

 

  

Short title and 

commencement 

 

 

 

Amendment of 

section 3 - 

 

 

 

 

 

Amendment of 

Section 4 - 

  

 

 

Amendment of 

Section 5 -  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

1.  (1) This Act may be called the Mizoram Salaries and Allowances of 

 Minister (Amendment)Act, 2019. 

     (2) It shall be deemed to have come  into force on the 1
st
 day of 

 April, 2019. 

 

2.  In the Mizoram Salaries and Allowances of Minister Act, 

 1999(hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act) in section 3, for the 

 words “forty thousand” the words “eighty thousand” shall be 

 substituted. 

 

 

3.  In section 4 of the Principal Act, for the words  “ten thousand

 rupees” the words “forty thousand rupees” shall be  substituted. 

 

 

 

4.  In section 5 of the Principal Act, for the words “to the Chief Minister 

Family allowances of ten thousand rupees, to the Minister eight 

thousand rupees and to the Minister of State five thousand rupees per 

mensem. An Entertainment allowance of rupees ten thousand to the 

Chief Minister, rupees five thousand to the  Minister and rupees three 

thousand to the Minister of State per  mensem.” the words “to the 

Chief Minister Family allowance of twenty seven thousand rupees, to 

the Minister eighteen  thousand rupees and to the Minister of State 

fifteen thousand rupees per mensem. An Entertainment allowance of 

rupees twenty five thousand to the Chief Minister, rupees eighteen 

thousand to the Minister and rupees ten thousand to the Minister of 

State per mensem” shall be substituted. 

 

 

 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Amendment of 

Section 6 -  

 

 

 

Amendment of 

Schedule 

 

5.  In section 6 of the principal Act, for the words “ten thousand” the 

 words “twelve thousand” shall be substituted. 

 

 

6.  In para 1 of the Schedule of the Principal Act, for the words “one 

thousand rupees outside Mizoram, and seven hundred fifty within 

Mizoram respectively” the words “two thousand rupees outside 

Mizoram and one thousand rupees within Mizoram” shall be 

substituted. 

 


